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Laura Belin <laurarbelin@bleedingheartland.com>

records request: communications with U.S. Treasury Department

idom.info@iowa.gov <idom.info@iowa.gov> Fri, Mar 4, 2022 at 9:39 AM
To: Laura Belin <laurarbelin@bleedingheartland.com>

The Department of Management has received your request.

On Fri, Mar 4, 2022 at 9:34 AM Laura Belin <laurarbelin@bleedingheartland.com> wrote:
No one acknowledged receipt of this request, so I am following up.

On Tue, Mar 1, 2022 at 8:05 PM Laura Belin <laurarbelin@bleedingheartland.com> wrote:
To the IDOM public records custodian:

Under Iowa Code Chapter 22, I request the following public records:

1. Copies of all written correspondence between Iowa Department of Management officials and officials at the
U.S. Treasury Office of Inspector General regarding the use of Coronavirus Relief Fund money to cover part of
the salaries of staff in the governor's office, The time frame for this request is any correspondence between
August 1, 2020 and December 31, 2021.

2. A copy of the 159-page packet IDOM provided to the State Auditor's office in December 2021, referenced in
the attached report. 

3. Copies of all written correspondence between Iowa Department of Management officials and staff in the
governor's office, from November 1, 2021 to December 31, 2021, related to the use of CARES Act funds to pay
staff salaries and the state auditors' findings.

To reduce printing and photocopying costs, and to facilitate social distancing, I request that these materials be
provided in digital format and sent to me via email.

Thank you in advance.

Yours,

Laura Belin
-- 

1705 Plaza Circle
Windsor Heights, IA 50324
(515) 276-6971
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